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SPORT OPPONENT LOCATION GAME TIME RELEASE TIME 

V Field Hockey Torrey Pines Home 4:00pm 2:45pm  

Cheer  Ramona Ramona 4:15pm 3:10pm  

JV Football Ramona Ramona 4:15pm 2:20pm  

JV Field Hockey Torrey Pines Home 5:15pm   

V Football Ramona Ramona 7:00pm   

      

 
Club Meetings: 
 

 Attention Seniors today is the last day to 
submit your Senior Quote. See the Yearbook 
tab on the SP Home page for the Google Form 
link or visit Ms. Hawkins in room 601. 

 
 Attention all writers! The French Club is 

continuing to write it's Halloween murder 
mystery. If you would like to be involved, 
please meet in Room 208 at lunch today 
FRIDAY. 

 
 Boys Soccer meeting at lunch on room 913 on 

Oct. 20 all players welcome.   
 

 Any girls interested in wrestling, please attend 
out first meeting this coming Monday, October 
18th at lynch in the Gym. 
 

 
 Attention Students: 

Come to Saturday Scholars this Saturday! 
Saturday Scholars begins at 8:30 and goes 
until 12:30. 
Attending Saturday Scholars clears truancies, 
absences and tardys. 
Check out the Saturday Scholars tab on the 
SPHS website or check the attendance office 
windows for a list of Saturday Scholars 
sessions being offered. 
 
Seniors: 
Come to Saturday Scholars this Saturday to 
get help with financial aid and college 
applications. 
Counselors will be in the Career Center to 
assist with FAFSA and California Dream Act 
applications. 
Ms. Duran and Ms. Espinosa will be in room 
911 hosting a college application workshop. 
 
 

 
 
 
Take advantage of all the great support SP is 
offering Seniors with financial aid and college 
apps at Saturday Scholars this week!! 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 

“Have a great day Eagles.  Remember United We Soar!”  
                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                              

 
San Pasqual Golden Eagles know our ABC’s, we 

are Academically Engaged 
Behaving Positively 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


